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STEWARDS REPORT  

 

Club:           Tasmanian Trotting Club  

Date:           Sunday 22nd October 2023 

Weather:           Fine 

Track           Good 

Stewards Panel:       Chair  

      Panel  

Panel/Data  

Inspections  

 Swabs                             

          J Gleeson 

          N Finnigan 

          R Brown 

          R Simpson 

          E Dunbabin 

Officials:                Starter 

Veterinarian  

Raceday Medical Providers 

          Mr A Emery  

          Dr J Buckerfield  

          Medical Edge  

 

 

Due to drivers, Mr T Rattray and Mr G Rattray being unavailable to drive at the meeting 
tonight, Stewards approved the following driving changes: 

 

R1 #1 MORE THAN THIS – R Hillier & #4 NYACK – R Duggan 

R4 # 7 MILLIES CREATION – B Rattray 

R5 #6 SWIATEK LEIS – B Rattray 

R6 # 6 MIKI SANZ – J Walters 

R7 #1 ROCKANDAHARDPLACE – C Castles & #7 SUNNY SANZ – J Walters 

R8 #5 LOOBY LOMBO – R Duggan 

R9 #2 SABALENKA LEIS – R Duggan 

 

  



RACE 1 – TASMANIAN HORSE TRANSPORT TASMANIAN 3YO GUINEAS – 2090m 
Mobile 

MORE THAN THIS raced roughly as the field raced out of the home straight on the final 
occasion. 

 

RACE 2 – PRYDES EASIFEED EVICUS HEAT ONE – 1609m Mobile 

ELIZABETH DELILAH failed to circle and has been placed on its last chance in the 
mobile draw. 

MACKEON hung in as the field raced around the home turn on the final occasion. 

TAMBROS TILLY hung in as the field raced into the home straight on the final occasion. 

DARE YOU TO MOVE gave ground over the concluding stages to be beaten in excess 
of 46 metres. 

 

RACE 3 – PRYDES EASIFEED DANDY PATCH HEAT ONE – 2090m Mobile 

The start of this event was delayed due to Richmond Greyhounds running late. 

TASSIE DAZZLER hung out shortly after the start, contacting the sulky of THUNDER 
SANZ, and sustaining a flat tyre. 

TASSIE DAZZLER pulled hard during the early and middle stages and was retired from 
the event. Driver M Yole reported the gelding had choked down and was pulled up in the 
interests of safety. TASSIE DAZZLER has been stood down until the completion of a 
satisfactory trial. Trainer B Yole advised that the gelding will be sent for a short spell. 

VINCENTAUR hung out and contacted the sulky of CUZZY BRO as the field raced into 
the home straight on the final occasion. 

SERIOUSLY SAM has been placed back in the draw for future mobile start events. 

 

RACE 4 – CAVALOR EQUICARE 3YO FILLIES CHAMPIONSHIP – 2090m Mobile 

The start of this event was delayed due to Richmond Greyhounds running late. 

JULEPE SANZ was caught wide early and restrained to the rear of the field. 

AREYAWATCHINGTHIS gave ground to be beaten in excess of 52 metres. 

 

RACE 5 – PRYDES EASIFEED EVICUS HEAT TWO – 1609m Mobile 

The start of this event was delayed due to Grafton Greyhounds running late. 

ORTEM MISS broke shortly after the start. This filly has been placed outside the draw 
for future mobile start events. 

GLENWOOD BEAUTY raced roughly shortly after the start. 

 

RACE 6 – PRYDES EASIFEED DANDY PATCH HEAT TWO – 2090m Mobile 



IDEN KAMAKAZI was out of position at the candy pole and will continue to be placed 
outside the draw in future mobile start events. This gelding also raced roughly over the 
concluding stages. 

MIKI SANZ raced greenly as the field raced into the back straight on the first occasion. 

  

RACE 7 – LADBROKE IT PACE– 2090m Mobile 

The start of this event was delayed approximately 4 minutes due to a RACKEMUP 
TIGERPIE requiring its off side front shoe to be replaced.  

Stewards questioned drivers Nathan Ford (AHA REACTION NZ) and Ewa Justice (HULI 
NIEN) along with stable representative Rohan Hillier (HULI NIEN) into the reason why 
there was a locking of sulky wheels on entering the first turn, before HULI NIEN broke 
gait and AHA REACTION NZ raced rough. Stewards, after taking evidence from both 
drivers and acting on their own observations could not place the blame for this incident 
on any one driver or horse, as both drivers had contested the one-out position which 
brought them together, initially caused the locking of sulky wheels, and as such took no 
action other than to note the circumstances. Stewards in assessing the incident noted 
HULI NIEN, which had drawn the inside of the second row, was racing ungenerously 
from the start as driver Justice restrained the gelding to move away from the inside line, 
in an attempt to be positioned in the one-out line. Meanwhile, driver Ford, who had 
begun from barrier 3 on the front row, began well and was in the process of moving AHA 
REACTION NZ down the track, also in an attempt to secure the one-out line. These 
simultaneous movements brought the sulkies together resulting in the locking of wheels, 
Stewards further noted, when the drivers attempted to disengage the wheels, HULI 
NIEN became unbalance, resulting in its hind leg striking the sulky of AHA REACTION 
NZ, with the result of HULI NIEN breaking gait and AHA REACTION NZ to racing rough. 

SUNNY SANZ inconvenienced when HULI NIEN and AHA REACTION NZ locked 
wheels. 

CULLENBURN NZ inconvenienced when HULI NIEN and AHA REACTION NZ locked 
wheels. 

Trainer Troy Hillier (HULI NIEN and HICKSTEAD NZ) was reprimanded under AHRR 
238 for failing to comply with a requirement under Harness Racing Policy 36, in that a 
trainer with two or more runners in a race must notify Stewards of the intended tactics of 
each runner no later than 60 minutes prior to the race. 

 

RACE 8 – YOUNG GROUP PACE – 2090m Mobile 

Driver R Hillier (MIA RAGAZZA) pleaded guilty to a charge under AHRR 162(1)(h) in that 
he failed to come fully into position at the start of this race. Mr Hillier was fined the sum 
of $100. 

 

RACE 9 – NUTRIEN SPRINTLANE PACE – 2090m Mobile 

LOU LOUS ALLGOLD broke during the score up causing a false start. This mare has 
been placed outside the draw in future mobile start events. 

FEELS LIKA BOSS sustained a flat tyre during the running of this event. 

ULTIMATE ME NZ tired to be beaten in excess of 193 metres. This gelding underwent a 
post-race veterinary examination which revealed it had bled from one nostril, 



consequently ULTIMATE ME NZ has been stood down until the completion of a 
satisfactory trial. 

 

RACE 10 – DYNAMO 10TH NOVEMBER PACE – 2090m Mobile 

SMILE LYLE was caught wide early and restrained to the rear of the field. 

RAMBUNCTIOUS pulled hard throughout and tired to be beaten in excess of 69 metres.  

This gelding has been placed on its last chance to race competitively. 

PRIDDY EASY tired to be beaten in excess of 67 metres. This gelding has been placed 
on its last chance to race competitively. 

KARALTA DAZZLER tired to be beaten in excess of 82 metres. This gelding underwent 
a post-race veterinary examination which revealed no apparent abnormalities. KARALTA 
DAZZLER has been placed on its last chance to race competitively. 

 

 

                                                      RACE MEETING SUMMARY 

 Race Details AHR Rule 

Suspensions:  Nil  

Fines: 8 R Hillier – Fail to come into position – FINE $100 162(1)(h) 

Reprimands: 7 T Hillier – Fail to notify tactics 238 

Horse Action: 3 TASSIE DAZZLER – SD1T 103 

 3 SERIOUSLY SAM - BMD  

 5 ORTEM MISS - ODM  

 6 IDEN KAMAKAZI - CODM  

 9 LOU LOUS ALLGOLD - ODM  

 9 ULTIMATE ME – SD1T 101B (2) 

Pre-race Swabs 1 NANCESTIGER 

NYACK 

 

 4 REELY NAUTI  

MILLIES CREATION NZ  

IDEN LADY LINCOLN 

 

 6 VINCENZO 

CUSTOM HARLEY 

 

 7 HULI NIEN 

RACKEMPUP TIGERPIE 

 

 8 MONEYS NO ISSUE  

Post-race Swabs:  ALL WINNERS  



Adjourned/Pending 
Inquiries: 

 NIL  

 

 


